Sumner County Board of Education

Del R. Phillips 111, Ph.D.
Director of Schools
695 East Main Street  Gallatin, TN 37066-2472
Phone: (615) 451-5200 Fax: (615) 451-5216

Bid Minutes
Sumner County Sheriff’s Office Vehicles
Facilities Building — Airport Road

Sealed bids were opened on September 02, 2015 at 10:00am at the Larry Riggsbee Facilities Building,
1500 Airport Road, Gallatin, Tennessee for Sumner County Sheriff’s Office Vehicles.

Present for the bid opening were:

Chris Harrison Sumner County Board of Education
Stacy Davis Sumner County Board of Education
Frank Ventura Ford of Murfreeshoro

Monty Green Sumner County Sheriff’s Department
Don Badacour Sumner County Sheriff’s Department

Bid responses were received from the following companies:

Boswells Harley Davidson
401 Fesslers Lane
Nashville, TN 37210

Golden Circle Ford
1432 Hwy 45 Bypass
Jackson, TN 38305

Ford of Murfreesboro
1550 Northwest Broad Street
Murfreesboro, TN 37129

Town & Country Ford
101 Anderson Lane
Madison, TN 37115

Ford — Lincoln of Franklin
1129 Murfreesboro Road
Franklin, TN 37064

Board of Education Members
Alice Bachman - Tim Brewer - David A. Brown — Patricia Brown — Jeff Cordell - Beth Cox - Andy Daniels - Dr. Nancy Glover - Glen Gregory — Tammy Hayes — Ted Wise



2015/2016 Police Interceptor Utility AWD
2015/2016 SUV 4x4 Base (K8B)
2015/2016 Truck Regular Cab 4x4
2015/2016 Truck Super Cab 4x4
2015/2016 Passenger Van

2015/2016 Motorcycle

Boswell's Harley Davidson

BID TABULATION
SUMNER COUNTY SHERIFF'S OFFICE VEHICLES

September 2, 2015

Golden Circle Ford

Ford of Murfreesboro

Town & County Ford

Ford Lincoln of Franklin

NO BID 27,202.00 26,755.00 27,109.00 32,545.00
NO BID 27,109.00 27,159.00 27,239.00 34,688.87
NO BID 24,230.00 23,150.00 24,875.00 33,772.79
NO BID 26,775.00 25,395.00 27,402.00 39,098.79
NO BID 32,197.00 27,638.00 NO BID 41,619.25
18,680.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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