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Bid Minutes 
Sheriff’s Office Tire Service 

Facilities Building – Airport Road 
 
 
Sealed bids were opened on September 15, 2015 at 9:00am at the Larry Riggsbee Facilities Building, 
1500 Airport Road, Gallatin, Tennessee for Sheriff’s Office Tire Service. 
 
 
Present for the bid opening were: 
 
Chris Harrison    Sumner County Board of Education 
Stacy Davis    Sumner County Board of Education 
 
Bid responses were received from the following companies: 
 
Gateway Tire & Service Center 
380 Hancock Street 
Gallatin, TN 37066 
 
 
TBC Retail Group DBA 
National Tire & Battery 
956 Grassland Place 
Gallatin, TN 37066 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  



GATEWAY TIRE & SERVICE NATIONAL TIRE & BATTERY

Make Model Size
Speed 
Rating

Chevy Impala (3.9) 225/60R16 V NO BID $111.41
Chevy Impala (3.5) P225/65R16 S ** $103.00 $100.85
GMC Envoy P245/65R17 S ** $133.78 $105.22
Ford Crown Vic 235/55R17 W NO BID $133.00
Ford Escape 225/70R16 S $97.00 $135.36
Ford Escape P235/70R16 S $102.87 $105.65
Ford Explorer 245/55R18 V $121.95 $139.63
Ford Explorer 245/60R18 H $143.58 $144.76
Ford Explorer 245/65R17 S ** $133.78 $105.22
Ford F150 235/75R17 T $142.64 $133.21
Ford F150 265/70R17 S $136.18 $119.87
Ford F250 LT245/75R17 $156.00 $132.88
Ford E350 LT245/75R16 $133.00 $132.81
Dodge Ram 1500 265/70R17 S $136.81 $119.87

265/75R17 S NO BID NO BID
P215/60R16 S $65.00 $77.20

OTHER SERVICES:
Complete Alignment $55.00 $76.49
Flat Tire Repair $12.50 $16.99
Install TMPS Sensor supplied by Owner * $12.50 $16.99
Turn Brake Rotors (brought to you loose) $20.00 $12.75
Hourly Labor Charge (if other work is desired) $75.00 $82.75

* Program fee for some sensors $37.50 Plus TPMS rebuild kits where applicable
** H rate tire. S rated going to H rating. Goodyear pricing may change when

Goodyear TN state contract is renewed
Mount & Balance Fee per tire = $12.50
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