
2019-2020

JACKETS
511 TACTICAL REVERSIBLE HI-VIS DUTY JACKET*** NOT AVAILABLE

RED KAP JP 68BK*** 53.00$      SUMMIT

TAYLORS G4461 Z LEATHER BLACK*** 285.00$    SUMMIT

***INCLUDE SEWING ON PROVIDED AGENCY PATCHES

RAIN GEAR
TACT SQUAD LONG RAINCOAT 6011 BLK/HI-VIS*** 48.00$      SUMMIT

LIBERTY 587MFL JACKET W/HOOD REV. BLK/HI-VIS*** 52.00$      SUMMIT

SPIEWAK PARKA HI-VIS S578V *** 155.90$    SUMMIT

***SHERIFF 3" LETTERS WHITE ON BLK & BLK ON HI-VIS

SPIEWAK REVERSIBLE DUTY PANTS S305V 65.00$      SUMMIT

HEADWEAR & CAPS
STRATON S-40 TM GRN. TRIPLE BRIM CAMPAIGN HAT  

W/BLACK LEATHER STRAP COLOR FOREST GREEN 72.00$      SUMMIT

CAMPAIGN HAT CORDS (GOLD & SILVER) 6.00$        CMS

CAMPAIGN HAT RAIN COVERS 2.50$        CMS

BASEBALL CAP-GOLD & SILVER SHERIFF ON FRONT 8.00$        CMS

SOCK HAT WITH S.C.S.O  GOLD & SILVER 6.00$        CMS

UNIFORM SHIRTS  
FLYING CROSS 33W7804Z (M) L/S*** 35.75$      SUMMIT

FLYING CROSS 85R7804Z  (M) S/S*** 32.00$      SUMMIT

***TALLS ALSO IF POSSIBLE

FLYING CROSS 126R7804Z (W) L/S 35.75$      SUMMIT

FLYING CROSS 176R7804Z (W) S/S 32.00$      SUMMIT



BLAUER 8670 L/S (W) & (M) 42.00$      SUMMIT

BLAUER 8675 L/S (W) & (M) 40.00$      SUMMIT

BLAUER 8731 L/S (M) SILVERTAN & OD-GREEN 40.00$      SUMMIT

BLAUER 8741 S/S (M) SILVERTAN & OD-GREEN 38.21$      CMS

***INCLUDE SEWING ON PROVIDED AGENCY PATCHES

AND/OR LEFT CHEST BADGE & RIGHT CHEST TITLE/NAME

DRESS TIES-GREEN 18", 20", 22" TIES 3.50$        SUMMIT

UNIFORM PANTS
HORACE SMALL H.S. 2145 GRN (M) INC. HEMMING 29.50$      SUMMIT

HORACE SMALL H.S. 2477 GRN (W) INC. HEMMING 29.50$      SUMMIT

TACT SQUAD MB200 GRN (MOTORCYCLE PANTS) M 105.00$    CMS

POLO SHIRTS  
BLAUER PERFORMANCE 8134 S/S (M) 30.25$      CMS

BLAUER PERFORMANCE 8134W S/S (W) 30.25$      CMS

5.11 PROFESSIONAL 41060 S/S (M) 31.78$      SUMMIT

5.11 PROFESSIONAL 41060T S/S (M) 33.00$      SUMMIT

5.11 PROFESSIONAL 61166 S/S (W) 31.78$      SUMMIT

TRU-SPEC 24/7 40/60 PLAITED L/S & S/S(M) 29.50$      CMS

TRU-SPEC 24/7 40/60 PLAITED L/S & S/S (W) 29.50$      CMS

CORNERSTONE TACTICAL CS410LS  L/S (M) 28.00$      CMS

511 1/4 ZIP JOB SHIRT 72314      REG 45.00$      SUMMIT

                                                           TALL 55.00$      CMS

***ALL ABOVE ITEMS MAY INCLUDE LEFT CHEST BADGE

& RIGHT CHEST TITLE/NAME EMBROIDERY

DRESS SHIRTS 



PORT AUTHORITY S 608 L/S  (M) 17.30$      SUMMIT

PORT AUTHORITY L 608 L/S (W) 17.30$      SUMMIT

PORT AUTHORITY S 508 S/S (M) 17.00$      CMS

PORT AUTHORITY L 508 S/S (W) 17.00$      CMS

***ALL ABOVE ITEMS MAY INCLUDE LEFT CHEST BADGE

& RIGHT CHEST TITLE/NAME EMBROIDERY

TACTICAL UNIFORM SHIRTS
PROPPER F5312 L/S (M) 30.00$      SUMMIT

PROPPER F5311 S/S (M) 29.00$      SUMMIT

TRU-SPEC TACTICAL RESPONSE 1284 SHIRT 36.00$      SUMMIT

***ALL ABOVE ITEMS MAY INCLUDE LEFT CHEST BADGE

& RIGHT CHEST TITLE/NAME EMBROIDERY

TRAFFIC SAFETY VEST
511 5 POINT BREAKAWAY 49022 *** 30.00$      SUMMIT

***SHERIFF BACK & FRONT

BDU PANTS
PROPPER TACTICAL F5254-50 6.4 OZ. (W) 28.50$      SUMMIT

PROPPER TACTICAL F5252-50 6.4 OZ. (M) 28.50$      SUMMIT

PROPPER 65/35 RIP-STOP F5201-38 24.20$      CMS

BLAUER 8831 (W) & (M) 37.00$      SUMMIT

BLAUER 8836 (W) & (M) 37.00$      SUMMIT

511-STRYKE 74369 54.00$      SUMMIT

TRU-SPEC TACTICAL RESPONSE 1285 PANTS 35.85$      CMS

RED KAP TWILL SLACKS PT38BK 24.00$      SUMMIT

BOOTS & FOOTWEAR
MERRELL JUNGLE MOC LEATHER WATERPROOF ICE 

COLORS:  BOULDER 78.00$      GALLS



                   MERRELL OAK 85.00$      SUMMIT

MERRELL MOAB2 FX-624 BELU 92.00$      GALLS

511-12001 8" (M) REG & WIDE 72.50$      SUMMIT

511-12018 6" (M) REG & WIDE 67.50$      SUMMIT

511-12007 8" (W) REG & WIDE 72.50$      SUMMIT

511-12025 6" (W) REG & WIDE 67.50$      SUMMIT

ROCKY FORT HOOD 8" ZIP FQ0002149 (M) REG & WIDE 77.00$      SUMMIT

ROCK ALPHA FORCE 8"  FQ0002165 (M) REG & WIDE 79.00$      SUMMIT

ROCK ALPHA FORCE 6"  FQ0002167 (M) REG & WIDE 74.00$      SUMMIT

ROCK ALPHA FORCE 8"  FQ0004165 (W) REG & WIDE 79.00$      SUMMIT

ROCK ALPHA FORCE 6"  FQ0004167 (W) REG & WIDE 74.00$      SUMMIT

CHIPPEWA OTC 71418  (M) REG & WIDE 212.00$    SUMMIT

HOLSTERS
SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6360 STXT ALS LEV III MID RIDE ( R) 112.00$    SUMMIT

SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6360 STXT ALS LEV III MID RIDE  (L) 112.00$    SUMMIT

SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6360 STXT ALS W/M3LIGHT 125.00$    SUMMIT

TLR1++LASER TAC 2 SUREFIRE X 200 MID-RIDE ( R)

SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6360 STXT ALS W/M3LIGHT 125.00$    SUMMIT

TLR1++LASER TAC 2 SUREFIRE X 200 MID-RIDE (L)

SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6378 STXT ( R) 37.00$      SUMMIT

SAFARILAND BLK/MATT 6378 STXT (L) 37.00$      SUMMIT

FLASHLIGHT RE-CHARGEBLE BATTERIES
STREAMLIGHT STL-75375 3.6V NIMH STICK 16.85$      SUMMIT

STREAMLIGHT STL-75903 TRAFFIC WAND (STL-75812 LIGHT) 4.85$        CMS

UTILITY BELTS & EQUIPMENT-BIANCHI ACCUMOLD



BELT 7200 28W-52W 36.65$      CMS

CUFF CASE 7344 (OPEN FACE) 15.67$      CMS

SPRAY HOLDER BI 7307 (MKS) 15.00$      CMS

MAG. HOLDER BI 7302 24.00$      CMS

MAG. HOLDER BI 7320 (OPEN) 21.35$      CMS

BELT KEEPERS BI 7406 (PK. OF FOUR) 9.35$        CMS

GLOVE CASE BI 7315 16.68$      CMS

RADIO CASE BI 7314 S 22.00$      CMS

FLASHLIGHT HOLDER 7326 10.70$      CMS

ASP HOLDER SIDE BREAK 52432 (PLAIN) 34.89$      CMS

BODY ARMOR-LEVEL II PROTECTION-2 CARRIER 500.00$    SUMMIT

 

SPL. EQUIPMENT
ASP 21" BLACKCHROME, MOLDED GRIPPS 89.00$      SUMMIT

FREEZE+P (TAZER 2K3) 2OZ. (NO SAFETY CAP) 11.00$      SUMMIT

DEEP FREEZE 17.5 FOGGER (AERKO INTERNATIONAL) 18.55$      CMS

FREEZE BLASTERS (TAZER 2K3) 18.00$      CMS

OLYMPUS AUDIO RECORDERS WS-853 80.00$      SUMMIT

SMITH&WESSON MOD.100 CHROME HANDCUFFS 22.00$      GALLS

SMITH&WESSON MOD.1900N CHROME LEG CUFFS 39.00$      SUMMIT

SMITH&WESSON BOOT CUFFS 65.00$      CMS

CTS THOMPSON 9000/9000c CHAIN LEGCUFF 61.00$      CMS

BADGES & COLLAR JEWELRY
BLACKINGTON B-1329 ARCHED, SAFETY PIN, FULL 

COLOR TN STATE SEAL BREAST BADGE:  GOLD 100.35$    CMS

                                                                  RHODIUM 87.50$      CMS

BLACKINGTON B-953 ARCHED, SAFETY PIN, FULL 

COLOR TN STATE SEAL BREAST BADGE:  GOLD 56.00$      SUMMIT

                                                                  RHODIUM 52.30$      CMS



BLACKINGTON B-960, ARCHED, SCREW NUT/NUT

FULL COLOR TN STATE SEAL, HAT BADGE:  GOLD 49.00$      SUMMIT

                                                                  RHODIUM 45.00$      SUMMIT

S.O. SILVER, SGT CHEVRONS GOLD, LT. BARS, CAPT 4.00$        CMS

BARS, MAJOR OAK CLUSTERS GOLD

RADIOS-MOBILE, PORTABLE, & ACCESSORIES

KMC-41 SPK/MIC NO BID

KMS-35 MIC NO BID

KMC-42W/WD NO BID

GRSMA-SH 3.5L EAR PIECE KIT NO BID

GRS AAT2 EAR PIECES NO BID

KRA-27 ANTENNA NO BID

KBH-11 BELT CLIP NO BID

KSC-32/32S CHARGER NO BID

PORTABLE RADIO BATTERIES
KENWOOD

KNB-22N NO BID

KNB-33L NO BID

KNB-45L NO BID

KNB-26A NO BID

KNB-14 NO BID

KNB-35L NO BID

KNB-26N NO BID

KNB-29N NO BID

KNB-57L NO BID

KNB-L2 NO BID


