Sumner County Board of Education

Scott Langford, Ed. D.
Director of Schools
695 East Main Street  Gallatin, TN 37066-2472
Phone: (615) 451-5200 Fax: (615) 451-5216

BID MINUTES
20230831
Bleacher Rental

Sealed bids were opened on August 31, 2023 at 10:00 a.m. at the Larry Riggsbee Support Services
Building, 1500 Airport Road, Gallatin, TN for 20230831.

Present for the bid opening were:

Chris Harrison Sumner County Board of Education
Janice Wright Sumner County Board of Education

Bid responses were received from the following proposers:
Production Management One, Inc.
8625 Inkster Road
Taylor, M1 48180
B&K Rentals and Sales Co., Inc.
15055 Marlboro Pike
Upper Marlboro, MD 20772

SEE ATTACHMENT FOR PRICING DETAILS

Board of Education Members
Sarah Andrews Tim Brewer Andy Daniels Josh Graham Glen Gregory Betsy Hawkins Tammy Hayes Steven King Andy Lacy Allen Lancaster Ted Wise



BEECH HIGH FOOTBALL FIELD

Home Side - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Visitor Side - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Misc. Additional Fees - Ground Start
GRAND TOTAL - Ground Start

Home Side - Elevated
Seating Capacity

Visitor Side - Elevated
Seating Capacity

Misc. Additional Fees - Elevated
GRAND TOTAL - Elevated

WHITE HOUSE HIGH FOOTBALL FIELD

Home Side - Ground Start
Misc. Additional Fees

GRAND TOTAL - Ground Start
Seating Capacity

Home Side - Elevated
Misc. Additional Fees
GRAND TOTAL - Elevated
Seating Capacity

B&K Rentals and Sales Co., Inc.

Production Management One, Inc.

Option 1 Option 2
$43,660.00 $43,365.00 $216,480.00
1,482 1,472 1,744
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $74,400.00
564 576 572
0 0 $53,590.00
$60,275.00 $60,334.00 $344,470.00
NO BID NO BID $189,760.00
1,348
NO BID NO BID $76,720.00
572
NO BID NO BID $59,440.00
$325,920.00
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $108,375.00
0 0 $27,640.00
$16,615.00 $16,969.00 $136,015.00
564 576 528
NO BID NO BID $88,560.00
0 0 $24,610.00
0 0 $113,170.00
564 576 408
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